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Bachelor of Science 
PROGRAM OUTCOME (PO) 

 Our graduates will understand the basic concepts, fundamental principles, and the 
scientific theories related to various scientific phenomena and their relevance in the day-
to-day life.  

 They will acquire the skill to design and conduct experiments, organize, analyze, and 
interpret data. 

 They will realize how developments in any science subject help in the development of 
other science subjects and vice-versa and how interdisciplinary approach helps in 
providing better solutions and new ideas for sustainable development.  

 Our graduates will have the interpersonal and communication skills to function as team 
players on multidisciplinary areas. 

 Our graduates will acquire the knowledge related to social health and safety, 
sustainability and environmental dimensions. 

 Our graduates will be able to effectively communicate technical information in speech, 
presentation and in writing. 

 Our graduates will develop confidence for self-learning and ability for life-long learning. 
 Our graduates will be able to participate and succeed in competitive examinations, 

different institute or university entrance examinations for higher studies. 

 

  



Bachelor of Arts 
PROGRAM OUTCOME (PO) 

 Our graduates will understand the basic concepts, fundamental principles, and the 
theories related to various socio-economic phenomena and their relevance in the day-to-
day life.  

 They will acquire the skill to design and conduct observation, organize, analyze, and 
interpret data. 

 They will realize how developments in any social science subject help in the 
development of other branches of the social science subjects and vice-versa and how 
interdisciplinary approach helps in providing better solutions and new ideas for 
sustainable development.  

 Our graduates will have the interpersonal and communication skills to function as team 
players on multidisciplinary areas. 

 Our graduates will acquire the knowledge related to social health and safety, 
sustainability and environmental dimensions. 

 Our graduates will be able to effectively communicate technical information in speech, 
presentation and in writing. 

 Our graduates will develop confidence for self-learning and ability for life-long learning. 
 Our graduates will be able to participate and succeed in competitive examinations, 

different institute or university entrance examinations for higher studies. 

 

  



Bachelor of Commerce 
PROGRAM OUTCOME (PO) 

 Our graduates will be able to prepare the accounts of any firm as they will have acquired 
the knowledge about the different branches of accounting and their application.  

 They will realize the importance of the development of the subject and will contribute 
towards it. They will also know that interdisciplinary approach will help provide better 
solutions and new ideas for sustainable development. 

 Our graduates will possess good interpersonal and communication skills and will be able 
to play a key role as team players on multidisciplinary areas. 

 They will acquire managerial abilities and also gain knowledge about working as 
financial managers. 

 Our graduates will be able to guide a firm regarding taking wealth management and 
investment decisions as they will acquire basic knowledge of financial markets. 

 They will develop confidence for self learning and ability for life-long learning. 
 Our graduates will be capable enough to crack different institute and university 

examinations for higher education and participate and succeed in competitive 
examinations for jobs. 

 
 

 

 


